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Gabriela Mistral understood the power of words. She worked hard in school and
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Editorial Review

From School Library Journal
Starred Review. Kindergarten-Grade 2–This lyrical homage to the Chilean Nobel Prize winner is a joy to
read. Written in the first person, the simple text follows the life of the poet from her earliest days (in which,
as a girl, she chooses her own name and teaches herself to read) to her internationally renowned career in
literature. Brown and the unnamed translator have created a poignantly poetic text that reads equally well in
English and in Spanish. It depicts, above all else, the poets lifelong love affair with words and stories. Parras
naive-style illustrations, which appear to be painted on wood, go well beyond complementing the text. They
offer a view into a softly colored world of people, places, and creatures, real or imagined, that were
described in Mistrals work. An exquisite addition for most collections.
Copyright © Reed Business Information, a division of Reed Elsevier Inc. All rights reserved.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Louie Thompson:

The book Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine) give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable considerably more increase. Book
can being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem along with your subject. If you
can make examining a book Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine) for
being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about some or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like available and read a guide
Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine). Kinds of book are several. It
means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

David Hedges:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for people. The book Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo
Gabriela (Rise and Shine) has been making you to know about other information and of course you can take
more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication Library Book: My Name Is
Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine) is not only giving you much more new information but also
being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to
make relationship using the book Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine).
You never experience lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Eddie Bussell:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider



while those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo
Gabriela (Rise and Shine) as the daily resource information.

Jose Rivera:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or make summary
for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and soul or real their
pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As
we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Library Book: My Name Is Gabriela/Me llamo Gabriela (Rise and Shine)
can make you really feel more interested to read.
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